
 
FOR IMMEDIATE RELEASE 
 

CareerSource South Florida Announces  
Career Pathways Scholarships  

 
● Explore a Variety of New Job Opportunities with More Than 132 Transformative 

Training Programs 
● Empowering Individuals with Up to $12,500 in Scholarship Funds 

 
MIAMI, FL – March 1, 2024 – CareerSource South Florida announces availability of scholarships 
to individuals seeking to boost their skills and advance their careers. Registration is now open for 
those interested in accessing up to $12,500 in scholarship funds. With over 132 individual training 
programs spanning various industries, job seekers can equip themselves with invaluable skills 
tailored to their respective career goals.  
 
From technology to healthcare, aviation to transportation logistics, hospitality, and beyond, our 
comprehensive training programs offer immersive, hands-on learning experiences under the 
guidance of experienced instructors. Whether individuals are seeking to enter a new field or 
advance within their current profession, the programs are designed to provide the necessary tools 
toward success. 
 
“We provide scholarships in training programs designed to empower individuals on a journey to 
economic mobility,” said Rick Beasley, Executive Director of CareerSource South Florida. “We 
are thrilled to extend this opportunity to residents in both Miami-Dade and Monroe Counties. 
 
For many, the prospect of upskilling can seem distant or financially unattainable. These programs 
serve as a catalyst, empowering job seekers to gain access to training and hands on experience 
that elevates their skills.  
 
Angel Batista, a graduate from one of the aviation training programs as an aviation technician, 
went on to say, “The program revealed a world of possibilities in the aviation industry, transforming 
my dedication into a fulfilling career.” 
 
Applying for a scholarship and choosing a program is simple. Visit a CareerSource South Florida 
Center, see here for a complete list.  As a proud partner of the American Job Center (AJC) 
network, CareerSource South Florida offers a wealth of resources and support to help job seekers 
achieve their career goals. 
 
About CareerSource South Florida 
CareerSource South Florida is a public-private partnership that establishes state and federally 
funded workforce development and training policies for Miami-Dade and Monroe Counties. 
CareerSource South Florida provides high quality, customized employment and training solutions 
to workers and employers in support of economic development. Services are available to 
everyone at no cost through a network of centers located throughout the region. For more 

https://iapps.careersourcesfl.com/itaprograms/
https://iapps.careersourcesfl.com/itaprograms/
https://www.careersourcesfl.com/career-center


information on CareerSource South Florida, including valuable resources for businesses and job 
seekers, please visit www.careersourcesfl.com. 
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